
16-02-B, Chevrolet Dealer Parts *Master Chevrolet Cadillac, LLC **Weaver Distributors, Inc.

August 13, 2015 at 3:00 p.m. Skip Garrett Jimmy Willis

Sharon Lyles and Mariruth Rogers 3625 Richland Avenue West 3904 Wrightsboro Road

Aiken SC 29801 Augusta GA 30809

Qty Part # Description Cost Per Annual Est Cost Per Annual Est

18 25910430 Tahoe front pads (6430) $164.86 $2,967.48 $121.60 $2,188.80

11 22742382 Tahoe front pads (6382) $110.77 $1,218.47 $81.70 $898.70

19 22950037 Tahoe front rotor (6787) $86.30 $1,639.70 $63.65 $1,209.35

10 22950036 Tahoe front rotor (6670) $91.45 $914.50 $67.45 $674.50

25 23112025 Tahoe rear pads (6454) $118.50 $2,962.50 $87.40 $2,185.00

10 25832103 Tahoe rear rotor (6103) $86.30 $863.00 $63.65 $636.50

10 19206117 C4500 Ambulance front pad (6117) $174.62 $1,746.20 $138.70 $1,387.00

10 89026795 C4500 Ambulance rear pad (6795) $136.34 $1,363.40 $108.30 $1,083.00

26 25877402 Tahoe wiper blades (1102) $15.53 $403.78 $12.35 $321.10

2 98090186 Ambulance fuel pressure sensor $342.97 $685.94 $252.97 $505.94

1 15173953 Ambulance switch $75.00 $75.00 $55.32 $55.32

1 92254456 Caprice bearing $73.90 $73.90 no bid $0.00

4 13586335 Tahoe tire sensor $52.15 $208.60 $38.47 $153.88

1 9596468 Tahoe wheel $169.05 $169.05 no bid $0.00

1 12576447 Tahoe belt $20.60 $20.60 $19.91 $19.91

1 19244746 Tahoe alternator $339.19 $339.19 $250.17 $250.17

1 92265457 Caprice rear pads $121.07 $121.07 $89.30 $89.30

1 13586335 Caprice sensor $52.15 $52.15 $38.47 $38.47

18 9596070 Tahoe lug nuts $4.54 $81.72 no bid $0.00

2 92246104 Caprice wheel $169.05 $338.10 no bid $0.00

1 19153711 Silverado fuel pump $268.33 $268.33 $173.08 $173.08

4 12471686 Tahoe seal $9.12 $36.48 $6.73 $26.92

4 12479031 Tahoe bearing $43.15 $172.60 $31.83 $127.32

1 12597567 Suburban valve $29.69 $29.69 $21.90 $21.90

1 13586335 Suburban sensor $52.15 $52.15 $38.47 $38.47

1 15148648 Ambulance light $67.62 $67.62 no bid $0.00

1 22853026 Tahoe headlamp $169.05 $169.05 no bid $0.00

3 22840115 Tahoe radiator $181.35 $544.05 $157.69 $473.07

1 88864065 Caprice battery $154.49 $154.49 $117.18 $117.18

5 92257988 Caprice front pads $94.02 $470.10 $69.35 $346.75

2 98002762 Ambulance mass air flow sensor $256.30 $512.60 $189.04 $378.08

1 15326386 Ambulance coolant sensor $21.64 $21.64 $15.96 $15.96



16-02-B, Chevrolet Dealer Parts *Master Chevrolet Cadillac, LLC **Weaver Distributors, Inc.

August 13, 2015 at 3:00 p.m. Skip Garrett Jimmy Willis

Sharon Lyles and Mariruth Rogers 3625 Richland Avenue West 3904 Wrightsboro Road

Aiken SC 29801 Augusta GA 30809

Qty Part # Description Cost Per Annual Est Cost Per Annual Est

1 23112025 Avalanche front pads $118.50 $118.50 $87.40 $87.40

2 22968231 Avalanche front rotor $86.30 $172.60 $63.65 $127.30

1 19256911 Tandum fuel filter $33.32 $33.32 $24.58 $24.58

1 10372867 Impala fuel cap $25.05 $25.05 $18.48 $18.48

1 10283834 Impala window switch $89.64 $89.64 $66.12 $66.12

2 20980075 Suburban rear hubs $354.37 $708.74 $261.37 $522.74

1 19210707 Suburban rear pads $104.33 $104.33 $76.95 $76.95

1 89046916 Silverado horn kit $47.66 $47.66 $35.74 $35.74

1 20938122 Tahoe sensor $56.35 $56.35 $41.56 $41.56

1 20989817 Impala wheel $89.86 $89.86 no bid $0.00

1 22854866 Impala wheel sensor $48.98 $48.98 $36.13 $36.13

1 15832313 Silverado AC control $178.58 $178.58 $131.72 $131.72

8 92260109 Caprice front rotor $94.02 $752.16 $69.35 $554.80

2 12479031 Silverado bearing $43.15 $86.30 $31.83 $63.66

3 12639277 Ambulance sensor $27.83 $83.49 $20.53 $61.59

1 89018365 Suburban actuator $174.84 $174.84 $128.95 $128.95

1 88964168 Caprice hub assembly $128.80 $128.80 $95.00 $95.00

3 88936107 Ambulance tie rod ends $152.44 $457.32 no bid $0.00

2 88936108 Ambulance tie rod ends $152.44 $304.88 no bid $0.00

1 19122423 Ambulance module $325.92 $325.92 $240.39 $240.39

1 24225963 Silverado transmission $1,943.50 $1,943.50 no bid $0.00

1 10396912 Silverado headlight assembly $145.92 $145.92 no bid $0.00

1 10396913 Silverado headlight assembly $145.92 $145.92 no bid $0.00

2 29539579 Ambulance transmission filter $30.88 $61.76 $24.35 $48.70

3 88892858 Ambulance power steering filter $24.96 $74.88 $18.41 $55.23

6 12639701 Ambulance glow plug $23.79 $142.74 $18.29 $109.74

1 97384667 Ambulance regulator $314.81 $314.81 no bid $0.00

1 15943453 Ambulance drag link $147.72 $147.72 no bid $0.00

1 89019318 Ambulance blower motor $105.51 $105.51 $77.82 $77.82

1 19209288 Impala water pump $116.77 $116.77 $86.12 $86.12

1 25971597 Impala headlight $105.84 $105.84 no bid $0.00

1 97365037 Ambulance crank sensor $65.27 $65.27 $59.24 $59.24



16-02-B, Chevrolet Dealer Parts *Master Chevrolet Cadillac, LLC **Weaver Distributors, Inc.
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Qty Part # Description Cost Per Annual Est Cost Per Annual Est

1 12621649 Impala oil pressure sensor $17.87 $17.87 $11.49 $11.49

1 19209249 Tahoe master cylinder $167.82 $167.82 $123.78 123.78

1 15233113 Tahoe wheel hub $270.32 $270.32 $199.39 $199.39

6 23209427 Tahoe key $36.31 $217.86 no bid $0.00

1 22818475 Tahoe door panel $301.58 $301.58 no bid $0.00

1 22789359 Tahoe shaft $280.17 $280.17 $206.64 $206.64

1 15812088 Silverado module $207.59 $207.59 $79.47 $79.47

2 98090186 Ambulance sensor $342.97 $685.94 $252.97 $505.94

1 15812088 Silverado module $207.59 $207.59 $79.47 $79.47

Estimated Annual Total $28,457.85 $17,371.81

*Total with local preference $28,457.85 $17,892.96

Did not bid all Chevrolet parts

Not GM part but OE equivalent

* Local Preference may apply .   

Ten (10) registered and suggested vendors were notified of the opportunity to submit bids.  Two (2) were received.

**One (1) was deemed non-responsive

The bid was advertised in the Aiken Standard on July 20, 2015

Recommendation of the Department Head:__________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Signature:________________________________________________________________________Date:________________________________________________ 

John Dyches  

  

Approval/Disapproval of the County Administrator: _______________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

Signature: ______________________________________________________Date:______________________________________________________________ 

Clay Killian  


